State of Oklahoma
Department of Central Services
Construction & Properties Division

BID TABULATION SHEET

Project Name:

Seal & Stripe Central Europe Road

DCS Project #:

12311

Project Location:

Camp Gruber Training Center, Braggs, OK

Bid Date:

7/31/2012

Using Agency:

Bidder's Name:

Oklahoma Military Department

PATTON & ASSOCIATES CONSTR. CO.

JLT CONTRACTING, LLC

Project Manager:

George Verstraete

City, State: TAHLEQUAH, OK CUSHING, OK
Notes:

Bid Scty| NO |Affidavits X Bid Scty] NO |Affidavits X Bid Scty Affidavits

Days 45 |Addendums Days 45 |Addendums Days 45 |Addendums

BASE BID

Description Est. Qty. Unit Price Total IEst. Qty. Unit Price Total Est. Qty. Unit Price Total
e neme oo onon e 1 $1,000.00 $1,000.00] 1 $5,415.00 $5415.00] 1 $0.00
0002 Fog Seal: 3,540 $6.45 $22,833.00] 3,540 $8.30 $29,382.00] 3,540 $0.00
0003 Traffic Stripe (Paint) (4” Wide) 32,800 $0.22 $7,216.00] 32,800 $0.15 $4,920.00] 32,800 $0.00
0004 Traffic Stripe (Paint) (24 Wide): 35 $45.00 $1,575.00] 35 $10.00 $350.00f 35 $0.00
TOTAL BASE OPTION BID: $32,624.00 $40,067.00

Description Est. Qty. Unit Price Total Est. Qty/| Unit Price Total Est. Qty. Unit Price Total

e sxamooonoonn NO BID s0.00] 1 $3,415.00 $3,415.00] 1 $0.00
o06 Penetrating Asphalt Conditoner 2,478 NO BID $0.00| 2,478 $10.25 $25,399.50| 2,478 $0.00
0007 Traffc Stipe (Pain) (4" wice) 32,800 NO BID $0.00| 32,800 $0.15 $4,920.00| 32,800 $0.00
e e stipe Stap tine (Pain) (247 35 NO BID s0.00] 35 $10.00 $350.00] 35 $0.00
TOTAL BASE OPTION BID: NO BID $34,084.50 $0.00




